

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

ASPHALT PRODUCTS

	Barrett	Broome Bituminous	Tri City Highway	Vestal Asphalt
AS-1 HOT MIX ASPHALT CURB	No Bid	\$98.00	No Bid	No Bid
AS-2 37.5 F9 BASE COURSE HMA 80 SERIES COMP	\$40.25	\$42.93	\$49.00	No Bid
AS-3 25 F9 BINDER COURSE HMA 80 SERIES COMP	\$41.40	\$44.75	\$51.00	No Bid
AS-4 19 F9 BINDER COURSE HMA 80 SERIES COMP	\$41.90	\$43.19	\$53.00	No Bid
AS-5 12.5 F2 TOP COURSE HMA 80 SERIES COMP	\$43.35	\$45.90	\$54.00	No Bid
AS-6 9.5 F2 TOP COURSE HMA 80 SERIES COMP	\$46.00	\$47.42	\$58.75	No Bid
AS-7 6.3 F2 POLYMER-MODIFIED HMA 80 SERIES COMP	\$56.45	\$58.30	\$64.00	No Bid
AS-8 MOD. STOCKPILE PATCHING				
MODIFIED STOCKPILE PATCHING	\$92.99	\$88.70	No Bid	\$118.35
FIBER REINFORCED PATCHING	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
AS-9 MISCELANEOUS PATCHING MATERIAL	\$48.00	\$49.33	No Bid	No Bid

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

LIQUID ASPHALT PRODUCTS

	Suit Kote	Vestal Asphalt				
LA-1 702-3102P (HFRS-2P) PER GAL	\$2.553	\$1.927				
LA-2 702-4101P (CSR-2P) PER GAL	\$2.573	\$1.927				

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

LIQUID CALCIUM PRODUCTS

	Suit Kote	Vestal Asphalt			
--	------------------	---------------------------	--	--	--

LC-1 LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE					
ALT #1 BULK DELIVERY PER GAL	\$1.25	\$1.20			
ALT #2 DELIVERED & APPLIED PER GAL	\$1.30	\$1.25			

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

STONE PRODUCTS

	Barrett	Tri City Highway	Schaefer	Gorick	Lopke
--	---------	------------------	----------	--------	-------

AGG-1 SELECT GRANULAR FILL					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$4.00	\$6.00	\$4.25	\$5.98
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$9.00	\$18.00	\$8.75	\$11.18

AGG-2 SUBBASE					
TYPE 2					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.00	\$5.35	\$6.08
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.50	\$10.75	\$11.98
TYPE 4					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$4.25	\$5.00	\$4.75	\$5.98
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$9.25	\$14.50	\$9.25	\$11.18

AGG-3 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 1					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$11.00	\$9.75	No Bid	\$11.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$16.95	\$18.00	No Bid	\$17.45

AGG-4 STONE FILL					
FINE STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00	\$11.00	\$9.98
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.60	\$17.85	\$15.98
LIGHT STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00	\$11.00	\$11.98
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.60	\$20.85	\$17.98
MEDIUM STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.00	No Bid	\$14.48
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.60	No Bid	\$23.48

	Barrett	Tri City Highway	Schaefer	Gorick	Lopke
--	---------	------------------	----------	--------	-------

AGG-4 STONE FILL (CONTINUED)

HEAVY STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.00	No Bid	\$15.48
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.60	No Bid	\$24.48
RIP RAP STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.75	No Bid	\$17.48
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.00	No Bid	\$26.48
BEDDING MATERIAL					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.00	No Bid	\$11.48
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.00	No Bid	\$17.48

AGG-5 CRUSHED STONE

1A STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	\$23.00	\$13.50	\$11.85	No Bid	\$13.20
ALT #2 DELIVERED	\$23.70	\$19.45	\$20.10	No Bid	\$19.20
1ST STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	\$23.00	\$13.25	\$11.85	No Bid	\$13.20
ALT #2 DELIVERED	\$23.50	\$19.20	\$20.10	No Bid	\$19.20
1 STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$12.00	\$9.75	No Bid	\$11.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$17.95	\$18.00	No Bid	\$17.45
2 STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$12.00	\$9.75	\$9.75	\$11.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$17.95	\$18.00	\$15.35	\$17.45
3A STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$13.50	\$9.75	No Bid	\$12.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$19.45	\$18.00	No Bid	\$18.45
3 STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$13.50	\$6.00	\$9.75	\$12.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$19.45	\$18.00	\$15.25	\$18.45

	Barrett	Tri City Highway	Schaefer	Gorick	Lopke
--	---------	------------------	----------	--------	-------

AGG-6 CRUSHED GRAVEL

1A STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$13.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.20
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$19.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.20
1ST STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$13.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.20
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$19.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.20
1 STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$12.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$17.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.45
2 STONE					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$12.00	No Bid	\$9.75	\$11.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$17.95	No Bid	\$15.35	\$17.45

AGG-7 ROAD SAND

ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$3.00	No Bid	\$3.00	\$8.45
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$7.65	No Bid	\$7.65	\$14.45

AGG-8 TOP SOIL

ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	\$12.50	\$11.85	\$12.80	\$13.50
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	\$17.50	\$20.10	\$17.45	\$19.50

AGG-9 EXTRA HEAVY STONE

TYPE A					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.00	No Bid	\$22.95
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.60	No Bid	\$32.95
TYPE B					
ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.00	No Bid	\$20.95
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.60	No Bid	\$30.95

AGG-10 EXTRA HEAVY STACKABLE

ALT #1 SUPPLIERS SITE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00	No Bid	\$24.95
ALT #2 DELIVERED	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.00	No Bid	\$34.95

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

EQUIPMENT RENTAL

	Bothar	Broome Bituminous	Suit Kote	Donegal
--	---------------	--------------------------	------------------	----------------

ER-1 ROLLERS

SINGLE DRUM				
PRICE PER DAY	No Bid	No Bid	\$775.00	No Bid
PRICE PER WEEK	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,000.00	No Bid
PRICE PER MONTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
MOBILIZATION CHARGE	No Bid	No Bid	\$525.00	No Bid
DUAL DRUM				
PRICE PER DAY	No Bid	\$345.00	\$825.00	No Bid
PRICE PER WEEK	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$4,125.00	No Bid
PRICE PER MONTH	No Bid	\$3,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
MOBILIZATION CHARGE	No Bid	\$290.00	\$550.00	No Bid

ER-2 COLD MILLING MACHINE

4' WIDE				
PRICE PER DAY	No Bid	\$3,500.00	\$3,300.00	\$3,600.00
PRICE PER WEEK	No Bid	\$18,500.00	\$16,000.00	\$17,500.00
PRICE PER MONTH	No Bid	\$76,000.00	\$63,000.00	\$66,000.00
MOBILIZATION CHARGE	No Bid	\$600.00	\$400.00	\$950.00
6' WIDE				
PRICE PER DAY	\$3,800.00	No Bid	\$3,700.00	No Bid
PRICE PER WEEK	\$19,000.00	No Bid	\$18,500.00	No Bid
PRICE PER MONTH	\$57,000.00	No Bid	\$75,000.00	No Bid
MOBILIZATION CHARGE	\$700.00	No Bid	\$400.00	No Bid
7' WIDE				
PRICE PER DAY	\$3,300.00	\$3,684.00	\$3,850.00	\$4,600.00
PRICE PER WEEK	\$19,000.00	\$18,700.00	\$18,900.00	\$22,500.00
PRICE PER MONTH	\$57,000.00	\$74,800.00	\$77,000.00	\$88,000.00
MOBILIZATION CHARGE	\$700.00	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
10' WIDE				
PRICE PER DAY	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,200.00	No Bid
PRICE PER WEEK	No Bid	No Bid	\$40,000.00	No Bid
PRICE PER MONTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
MOBILIZATION CHARGE	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,000.00	No Bid

ER-3 RUBBER TIRE EXCAVATOR

PRICE PER MONTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
-----------------	--------	--------	--------	--------

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

CONCRETE PRODUCTS

	Cranesville Block				
--	------------------------------	--	--	--	--

CP-1 FLOWABLE FILL					
PRICE PER CY	\$88.00				

CP-2 CEMENT CONCRETE					
CLASS A					
PRICE PER CY	\$115.00				
CLASS D					
PRICE PER CY	\$122.00				
CLASS E					
PRICE PER CY	\$118.00				
CLASS F					
PRICE PER CY	\$122.00				
CLASS HP					
PRICE PER CY	\$150.00				

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

SERVICE CONTRACTS

	Barrett Paving	Bothar	Broome Bituminous	Suit Kote	Tri City	Gorick	Vestal Asphalt	FAHS	Highway Rehab	OH Striping	DeAngelo Brothers	AnnSeal
SER-1 COLD IN PLACE RECYC.												
OPTION A (CENTRAL PLANT MIXING)												
3" IN DEPTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4" IN DEPTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFMS-1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFMS-2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFRA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOG SEAL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
POLYMER MODIFIER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
WORK ZONE TRAFFIC CONTROL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ADDITIONAL AGGREGATE / TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B (IN-PLACE RECYCLING TRAIN)												
3" IN DEPTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4" IN DEPTH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFMS-1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFMS-2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFRA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOGSEAL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
POLYMER MODIFIER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
WORK ZONE TRAFFIC CONTROL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ADDITIONAL AGGREGATE / TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SER-2 COLD MILLING												
0 - 2" PER SY	No Bid	\$2.92	\$2.67	\$2.955	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 1/16 - 4" PER SY	No Bid	\$4.40	\$3.45	\$3.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4 1/16 - 6" PER SY	No Bid	\$5.97	\$4.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SER-3 FULL DEPTH STABILIZATION												
THICKNESS RECYCLED (6 - 8 INCHES)												
0 - 12,320 SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12,321 - 36,960 SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36,961 - 73,920 SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
THICKNESS RECYCLED (8 - 10 INCHES)												
0 - 12,320 SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12,320 - 36,960 SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36,960 - 73,920 SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CHEMICAL STABILIZING AGENT PER GAL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BITUMINOUS STABILIZING AGENT PER GAL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
AGGREGATE PER TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

	Barrett Paving	Bothar	Broome Bituminous	Suit Kote	Tri City	Gorick	Vestal Asphalt	FAHS	Highway Rehab	OH Striping	DeAngelo Brothers	AnnSeal
--	-----------------------	---------------	--------------------------	------------------	-----------------	---------------	-----------------------	-------------	----------------------	--------------------	--------------------------	----------------

SER-4 MICROSURFACING

TYPE II												
0-150 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$290.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$225.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
151-300 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$160.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
301 - 500 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$155.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
500+ TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TYPE III												
0-150 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$290.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$230.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
151-300 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$158.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$205.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
301 - 500 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$122.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$180.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
500+ TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$148.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$170.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RUT FILLING	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$160.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$245.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOG SEAL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-5 COLD MIX PAVING PER TON

TYPE I												
INCLUDING AGGR & WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$104.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
EXCLUDING AGGR & WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$40.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$73.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TYPE II												
INCLUDING AGGR & WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$104.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
EXCLUDING AGGR & WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$40.93	No Bid	No Bid	\$73.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TYPE III												
INCLUDING AGGR & WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56.33	No Bid	No Bid	\$104.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
EXCLUDING AGGR & WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$41.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$73.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-6 CLEANING/SEALING CRACKS PER GAL

OPTION A INCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.00	\$17.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.72	No Bid	\$14.18
OPTION B EXCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.99	No Bid	\$12.10

SER-7 HOT MIX ASPHALT USING RECYCLING TREATMENTS PER TON

OPTION A INCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B EXCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-8 OVERLAY SLURRY SEAL

TYPE II F3 - ITEM 414.02030118												
0-150 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$280.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$210.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
151-300 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$190.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
301 - 500 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$170.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
500+ TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$140.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$160.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TYPE III F3 - ITEM 414.03030118												
0-150 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$280.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$215.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
151-300 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$148.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
301 - 500 TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$143.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
500+ TON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$138.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

	Barrett Paving	Bothar	Broome Bituminous	Suit Kote	Tri City	Gorick	Vestal Asphalt	FAHS	Highway Rehab	OH Striping	DeAngelo Brothers	AnnSeal
--	-----------------------	---------------	--------------------------	------------------	-----------------	---------------	-----------------------	-------------	----------------------	--------------------	--------------------------	----------------

SER-9 VEGETATION CONTROL

ROADSIDE MILEAGE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.53	No Bid
APPLIED MATERIAL PER GAL.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.83	No Bid

SER-10 SUBBASE COURSE, OPTIONAL TYPE

OPTION A INCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B EXCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-11 37.5 F9 BASE COURSE HMA, 80 SERIES COMPACT

OPTION A -W/PG 64S-22 INCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$82.90	No Bid	\$53.87	No Bid	\$66.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$65.60	No Bid	\$51.47	No Bid	\$62.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B -W/PG 64S-22 EXCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$78.40	No Bid	\$51.64	No Bid	\$65.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$63.70	No Bid	\$49.93	No Bid	\$61.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION C -W/PG 64V-22 INCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$86.40	No Bid	\$59.90	No Bid	\$69.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$69.10	No Bid	\$58.70	No Bid	\$65.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION D -W/PG 64V-22 EXCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$81.90	No Bid	\$58.90	No Bid	\$68.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$67.20	No Bid	\$57.70	No Bid	\$63.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-12 25 F9 BINDER COURSE HMA, 80 SERIES COMPACT

OPTION A -W/PG 64S-22 INCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$84.40	No Bid	\$54.50	No Bid	\$67.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$67.10	No Bid	\$53.50	No Bid	\$63.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B -W/PG 64S-22 EXCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$79.90	No Bid	\$52.90	No Bid	\$66.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$65.20	No Bid	\$51.50	No Bid	\$61.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION C -W/PG 64V-22 INCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$87.90	No Bid	\$59.50	No Bid	\$69.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$70.60	No Bid	\$58.50	No Bid	\$65.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION D -W/PG 64V-22 EXCLUDE WZTC													
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$83.40	No Bid	\$58.50	No Bid	\$68.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$68.70	No Bid	\$57.90	No Bid	\$64.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

	Barrett Paving	Bothar	Broome Bituminous	Suit Kote	Tri City	Gorick	Vestal Asphalt	FAHS	Highway Rehab	OH Striping	DeAngelo Brothers	AnnSeal
--	-----------------------	---------------	--------------------------	------------------	-----------------	---------------	-----------------------	-------------	----------------------	--------------------	--------------------------	----------------

SER-13 19 F9 BINDER COURSE HMA, 80 SERIES COMPACT

OPTION A -W/PG 64S-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$84.95	No Bid	\$54.25	No Bid	\$69.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$67.65	No Bid	\$52.87	No Bid	\$65.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B -W/PG 64S-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$80.45	No Bid	\$53.45	No Bid	\$68.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$65.75	No Bid	\$51.19	No Bid	\$63.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION C -W/PG 64V-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$88.45	No Bid	\$60.70	No Bid	\$71.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$71.15	No Bid	\$59.40	No Bid	\$67.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION D -W/PG 64V-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$83.95	No Bid	\$59.40	No Bid	\$70.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$69.25	No Bid	\$58.90	No Bid	\$65.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-14 12.5 F2 TOP COURSE HMA, 80 SERIES COMPACT

OPTION A -W/PG 64S-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$86.60	No Bid	\$58.60	No Bid	\$70.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$69.30	No Bid	\$57.40	No Bid	\$66.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B -W/PG 64S-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$82.10	No Bid	\$57.40	No Bid	\$69.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$67.40	No Bid	\$56.90	No Bid	\$64.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION C -W/PG 64V-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$90.60	No Bid	\$64.90	No Bid	\$73.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$73.30	No Bid	\$63.90	No Bid	\$69.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION D -W/PG 64V-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$86.10	No Bid	\$63.70	No Bid	\$72.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$71.40	No Bid	\$62.40	No Bid	\$67.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-15 9.5 F2 TOP COURSE HMA, 80 SERIES COMPACT

OPTION A -W/PG 64S-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$89.45	No Bid	\$58.45	No Bid	\$75.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$72.15	No Bid	\$54.93	No Bid	\$71.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B -W/PG 64S-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$84.95	No Bid	\$56.90	No Bid	\$74.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$70.25	No Bid	\$53.87	No Bid	\$69.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION C -W/PG 64V-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$93.45	No Bid	\$63.90	No Bid	\$77.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$76.15	No Bid	\$62.70	No Bid	\$73.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION D -W/PG 64V-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$88.95	No Bid	\$62.95	No Bid	\$76.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$74.25	No Bid	\$61.90	No Bid	\$72.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**2017 GENERAL HIGHWAY REQUIREMENT BID
RFB-2017-028**

	Barrett Paving	Bothar	Broome Bituminous	Suit Kote	Tri City	Gorick	Vestal Asphalt	FAHS	Highway Rehab	OH Striping	DeAngelo Brothers	AnnSeal
--	-----------------------	---------------	--------------------------	------------------	-----------------	---------------	-----------------------	-------------	----------------------	--------------------	--------------------------	----------------

SER- 16 6.3 F2 POLYMER MODIFIED HMA, 80 SERIES COMPACT

OPTION A -W/PG 64S-22 INCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$99.70	No Bid	\$65.90	No Bid	\$80.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$82.40	No Bid	\$64.65	No Bid	\$76.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B -W/PG 64S-22 EXCLUDE WZTC												
0 - 500 TON PER TON	\$95.20	No Bid	\$64.95	No Bid	\$79.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OVER 500 TON PER TON	\$80.50	No Bid	\$63.40	No Bid	\$75.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-17 HOT MIX ASPHALT CURB

OPTION A INCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	\$495.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B EXCLUDING WZTC	No Bid	No Bid	\$440.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-18 CHIP SEAL

OPTION A W/WZTC												
W/1A AGGREGATE PER SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
W/1ST AGGREGATE PER SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION B WITH FOG SEAL W/WZTC												
W/1A AGGREGATE PER SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
W/1ST AGGREGATE PER SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FOG SEAL PER GAL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
COVER SAND PER SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION C												
EXCLUDING AGGREGATE AND WZTC PER S	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

SER-19 TACK COAT APPLICATION - PER GAL

PER GAL	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.49	\$9.00	\$6.50	No Bid	\$7.654	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
---------	--------	--------	--------	--------	--------	--------	---------	--------	--------	--------	--------	--------